
In our quest to introduce new Events, the Centre is organising a 
Five Day Tour of the Highlands on the above dates. The idea 
behind this Event is to take in areas not previously covered and to 
give outlying members who do not normally attend the one day runs 
because of the distances involved, the opportunity to join in by 
taking the run to them. 

The format would be a "Jump on - Jump off" event, you will be able 
to join the run at any of the daily start points, it would be your 
decision whether to do one, two, three or more days The choice is  
yours. Simply indicate on the entry form which day you wish to start 
on and for how long. 

FIVE  DAY HIGHLAND TOUR 
Friday 21st  to Tuesday 25th August 2009 

CALEDONIAN CENTRE 

Day  1 Friday 21st Stirling to Ballachulish 150 miles 

Day  2 Saturday 22nd Ballachulish to Ullapool 205 miles 

Day  3 Sunday 23rd Ullapool to Thurso 167 miles 

Day  4 Monday 24th Thurso to Grantown-on-Spey 206 miles 

Day  5 Tuesday 25th Grantown-on-Spey to Creiff 146 miles 

Please Book me in on the Five Day Highland Tour joining on:- 

Day ……. Day & Date…………….….. Starting From ……………………………. For ……….. Days  

The Event will start in the Stirling area touring around the North of 
Scotland and finishing in Creiff. You will have the opportunity to 
drive the old 'Rest and be Thankful', and the 'Pass of the Cattle' on 
the Applecross peninsula, plus many more new and exciting roads 
with fantastic views as we head north.  

This will be a fairly informal Tour which we will offer shorter routes 
on some of the longer days if you feel the mileages are too much, 
but we have tried to provide the most picturesque and interesting 
routes as possible.  

We will offer Hotel accommodation each night and will endeavour 
to keep the costs to around the £50 to £65 per person per night 
Dinner, Bed & Breakfast or alternatively if you wish you can make 
your own accommodation arrangements. 

As numbers on this Tour will be limited please book early to avoid disappointment.  
Entries will close on 15th July or when the maximum number is reached. 

Proposed start points and mileages. Entry Fee £5 for the first day and £1 for each additional day (per car) 

Driver                                         Email Address 

Passenger Membership No. 

Address Centre 

 Car                     MG 

 Registration No 

Post Code Colour                           Year 

Telephone No. Please Supply Hotel Information  Yes / No 

Completed Entry Forms and Fees (cheques payable to MGCC Caledonian Centre) should be sent to:- 

David Reid, 11 Forth Park, Dalmeny, West Lothian. EH30 9HB. Telephone 0131 331 4135 


